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Mike Chevedden To George_Morino@toyota.com
<chevedden@imagespm.com>

&

LR

c¢c David Stovall <david_stovall@toyota.com>, "Joan J. Marino"
11/14/2007 01:33 PM <Joan_Marino@imagespm.com>, "Mark T. Kubota" <Mark_Kubota@toyota.com>,

b Richard Jung <Richard_Jung@toyota.com>, Wayne Hutchinson
cC

Subject Re: 70F/7LB data capture

el
L
%

Sorry about the "day/date”. A new habit I'm tying to forge. Will keep you posted.

Mike
On Nov 14, 2007, at 1:28 PM, George Morino@ Toyota.com wrote:

Mike:

I appreciate you keeping us in the loop. Please continue to keep us
updated on the progress. Especially the time on Monday in which we may
receive the file. Unless specified otherwise by Image Solutions, we expect
that Monday means, Monday (11/19/07) at 9:00 am.

Thank you for your continued hard efforts.

George Morino

National Manager

Quality Compliance Department
Product Quality and Service Support
Toyota Motor Sales, U.S.A., Inc.
Tel. 310-468-3392

Fax 310-468-3399

NOTICE: This email message and all attachments transmitted with it are
intended solely for the use of the addressee and may contain legally
privileged and confidential information. If the reader of this message is
not the intended recipient, or an employee or agent responsible for
delivering this message to the intended recipient, you are hereby notified
that any dissemination, distribution, copying, or other use of this message
or its attachments is strictly prohibited.
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If you have received this message in error, please notify the sender
immediately by email reply and please delete this message from your
computer. Thank you.

Mike Chevedden
<chevedden@images
pm.com> To
George Morino
11/14/2007 12:54 <george morino@toyota.cony>
PM cc

"Mark T. Kubota"

<Mark_ Kubota @tovota.com>, Richard

Jung <Richard Jung@toyeta.com>,

Wayne Hutchinson

<wayne hutchinson@toyota.corm>,

David Stovall

<david_stovall@toyota.com>, "Joan

J. Marino"

<Joan Marino @imagespr.com>
Subject

70F/7LB data capture

George,

just want to clarify the current projection for completion of the 70F/7LB
process. Every effort is being made to meet Friday, 11/16/07, project
completion. As with any new process the tasks are built on estimates. The
actual work sometimes varies. And we do not want to skip any QC steps in
order to meet a deadline.
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That being the case, there is a possibility that the job will not be

finished until Monday. If this occurs, pricing will be discounted
accordingly. I will keep the group informed as we move toward the end of
the week.

Best Regards,

Mlke

Image Solutions Print & Mail, Inc.
109 W. Grand Avenue

El Segundo, CA 90245
310-364-3117 /310-364-3171 FAX
www.imagespm.com

This transmission may contain information that is privileged, confidential
and/or exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If you are not the
intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any disclosure, copying,
distribution, or use of the information contained herein (including any

reliance thereon) is STRICTLY PROHIBITED. If you received this transmission

in error, please immediately contact the sender and destroy the material in
its entirety, whether in electronic or hard copy format. Thank you.
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Image Solutions Print & Mail, Inc.
109 W. Grand Avenue

El Segundo, CA 90245
310-364-3117 / 310-364-3171 FAX
WwWWw.imagespm.com

This transmission may contain information that is privileged, confidential
and/or exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If you are not the
intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any disclosure, copying,
distribution, or use of the information contained herein (including any
reliance thereon) is STRICTLY PROHIBITED. If you received this transmission
in error, please immediately contact the sender and destroy the material in
its entirety, whether in electronic or hard copy format. Thank you.
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