126 STAT. 556

PUBLIC LAW 112-141—JULY 6, 2012

SEC. 1402. OPEN CONTAINER REQUIREMENTS.

Section 154(c) of title 23, United States Code, is amended—

(1) by striking paragraph (2) and 1nsert1ng the following:
“(2) FISCAL YEAR 2012 AND THEREAFTER.—

“(A) RESERVATION OF FUNDS.—On October 1, 2011, and
each October 1 thereafter, if a State has not enacted or
is not enforcing an open container law described in sub-
section (b), the Secretary shall reserve an amount equal
to 2.5 percent of the funds to be apportioned to the State
on that date under each of paragraphs (1) and (2) of section
104(b) until the State certifies to the Secretary the means
by which the State will use those reserved funds in accord--
ance with subparagraphs (A) and (B) of paragraph (1)
and paragraph (3).

“(B) TRANSFER OF FUNDS.—As soon. as practicable after
the date of receipt of a certification from a State under
subparagraph (A), the Secretary shall—

“(1) transfer the reserved funds identified by the

State for use as described in subparagraphs (A) and

(B) of paragraph (1) to the apportionment of the State

under section 402; and

“(ii) release the reserved funds identified by the

State as described in paragraph (3).”;

(2) by striking paragraph (3) and 1nsert1ng the following:
“(3) USE FOR HIGHWAY SAFETY IMPROVEMENT PROGRAM.—
“(A) IN GENERAL.—A State may elect to use all or

- a portion of the funds transferred under paragraph (2) -

for activities eligible under section 148.

“(B) STATE DEPARTMENTS OF TRANSPORTATION.—If the
State makes an election under subparagraph (A), the funds
shall be transferred to the department of transportation
of the State, which shall be responsible for the administra--
tion of the funds.”: ;and
(3) by striking paragraph (5) and inserting the following:
“(5) DERIVATION OF AMOUNT TO BE TRANSFERRED.—The

amount to be transferred under paragraph (2) may be derived
from the following:

“(A) The apportlonment of the State under section
104(b)1).

“B) The apportionment of the State under section
104(b)(2).”.

SEC. 1403. MINIMUM PENALTIES FOR REPEAT _OFFENDERS FOR

DRIVING WHILE INTOXICATED OR DRIVING UNDER THE
INFLUENCE.

(a) DEFINITIONS.—Section 164(a) of title 23, United States Code,

. is amended—

(1) by striking paragraph (8);
(2) by redesignating paragraphs (4) and (5) as paragraphs

(3) and (4), respectively; and

(3) in paragraph (4) (as so redesignated) by striking

subparagraph (A) and inserting the following:

“(A) receive—
“1) a suspension of all dr1v1ng privileges for not
less than 1 year; or
. (i) a suspension of unlimited driving privileges
for 1 year, allowing for the reinstatement of limited



PUBLIC LAW 112-141—JULY 6, 2012 126 STAT. 557

driving privileges subject to restrictions and limited
exemptions as established by State law, if an ignition
interlock device is installed for not less than 1 year
on each of the motor vehicles owned or operated, or
both, by the individual;”
(b) TRANSFER OF FUNDS.—Section 164(b) of title 23, United
States Code, is amended—
. (D by striking paragraph (2) and inserting the following:
“(2) FISCAL YEAR 2012 AND THEREAFTER.—

“(A) RESERVATION OF FUNDS.—On October 1, 2011, and
each October 1 thereafter, if a State has not enacted or
is not enforcing a repeat intoxicated driver law, the Sec-
retary shall reserve an amount equal to 2.5 percent of
the funds to be apportioned to the State on that date
under each of paragraphs (1) and (2) of section 104(b)
until the State certifies to the Secretary the means by
which the States will use those reserved funds among
the uses authorized under subparagraphs (A) and (B) of
paragraph (1), and paragraph (3).

“(B) TRANSFER OF FUNDS.—As soon as practicable after
the date of receipt of a certification from a State under
subparagraph (A), the Secretary shall—

“{) transfer the reserved funds identified by the

State for use as described in subparagraphs (A) and

(B) of paragraph (1) to the apportionment of the State

under section 402; and

. “(ii) release the reserved funds identified by the -

State as described in paragraph (3).”;

(2) by striking paragraph (3) and inserting the following:
“3) USE FOR HIGHWAY SAFETY IMPROVEMENT PROGRAM.—

“(A) IN GENERAL.—A State may elect to use all or
a portion of the funds transferred under paragraph (2)
for activities eligible under section 148.

“(B) STATE DEPARTMENTS OF TRANSPORTATION.—If the
State makes an election under subparagraph (A), the funds
shall be transferred to the department of transportation

. of the State, which shall be responsible for the administra-
tion of the funds.”; ; and
(8) by striking paragraph (5) and inserting the following:
“5) DERIVATION OF AMOUNT TO BE TRANSFERRED.—The
amount to be transferred under paragraph (2) may be derived
from the following:

“(A) The apportionment of the State under section
104(b)(1).

- “(B) The apportionment of the State under section
104(b)(2) ”

SEC. 1404. ADJUSTMENTS TO PENALTY PROVISIONS.

(a) VEHICLE WEIGHT LIMITATIONS.—Section 127(a)(1) of title
23, United States Code, is amended by striking “No funds shall
be apportioned in any fiscal year under section 104(b)(1) of this
title to any State which” and inserting “The Secretary shall withhold
50 percent of the apportionment of a State under section 104(b)(1)
in any fiscal year in which the State”.

(b) CONTROL OF JUNKYARDS.—Section 136 of title 23, United
States Code, is amended—

(1) in subsection (b), in the first sentence—



126 STAT. 558 PUBLIC LAW 112-141—JULY 6, 2012

(A) by striking “10 per centum” and inserting “7 per-
cent”; and

(B) by striking “section 104 of this title” and 1nsert1ng
“paragraphs (1) through (5) of section 104(b)”; and
(2) by adding at the end the following:

“n) DEFINITIONS.—For purposes of this section, the terms ‘pri-
mary system’ and ‘Federal-aid primary system’ mean any highway
that is on the National Highway System, which includes the Inter-
state Highway System.”.

(c) ENFORCEMENT OF VEHICLE SIZE AND WEIGHT LAws.—Section
141(b)(2) of title 23, United States Code, is amended—

1 (1) by striking “10 per centum” and inserting “7 percent”;

an , .

(2) by striking “section 104 of this title” and inserting
“paragraphs (1) through (5) of section 104(b)”.

(d) ProoF oF PAYMENT OF THE HEAvY VEHICLE Usg TAX.—
Section 141(c) of title 23, United States Code, is amended—

(1) by striking “section 104(b)(4)” each place it appears
and inserting “section 104(b)(1)”; and

(2) in the first sentence by striking “25 per centum” and
inserting “8 percent”.

(e) USE OF SAFETY BELTS.—Section 153(h) of title 23, United
States Code, is amended—

(D by striking paragraph (1);

(2) by redesignating paragraph (2) as paragraph (1);

(3) in paragraph (1) (as so redesignated)—

. (A) by striking the paragraph heading and inserting

“PRIOR TO FISCAL YEAR 2012”; and

(B) by inserting- “and before October 1, 2011,” after
“September 30, 1994,”; and
(4) by inserting after paragraph (1) (as so redesignated)

the following:

“(2) FISCAL YEAR 2012 AND THEREAFTER.—If, at any time
in a fiscal year beginning after September 30, 2011, a State
does not have in effect a law described in subsection (a}(2),
the Secretary shall transfer an amount equal to 2 percent
of the funds apportioned to the State for the succeeding fiscal
year under each of paragraphs (1) through (8) of section 104(b)
to the apportionment of the State under section 402.”.

(f) NATIONAL MINIMUM DRINKING AGE.—Section 158(a)(1) of
title 23, United States Code, is amended—

(1) by striking “The Secretary” and inserting the following:

“(A) FISCAL YEARS BEFORE 2012.—The Secretary”; and
(2) by adding at the end the following:

“(B) FISCAL YEAR 2012 AND THEREAFTER.—For fiscal
year 2012 and each fiscal year thereafter, the amount
to be withheld under this section shall be an amount equal
to 8 percent of the amount apportioned to the noncompliant
State, as described in subparagraph (A), under paragraphs
(1) and (2) of section 104(b).”.

(g) DRUG OFFENDERS.—Section 159 of title 23, United States
Code, is amended—

(1) in subsection (a)—

(A) by striking paragraph (1);

(B) by redesignating paragraph (2) as paragraph (1);



PUBLIC LAW 112-141—JULY 6, 2012 126 STAT. 559

(C) in paragraph (1) (as so redesignated) by striking

“(ixécluding any amounts withheld under paragraph (1))”;

an

(D) by inserting after paragraph (1) (as so redesig-
nated) the following:

“(2) FISCAL YEAR 2012 AND THEREAFTER.—The Secretary
shall withhold an amount equal to 8 percent of the amount
required to be apportioned to any State under each of para-
graphs (1) and (2) of section 104(b) on the first day of each
fiscal year beginning after September 30, 2011, if the State
fails to meet the requlrements of paragraph (3) on the first
day of the fiscal year.”; and

(2) by striking subsection (b) and inserting the following:
“(b) EFFECT OF NONCOMPLIANCE.—No funds withheld under

this section from apportionments to any State shall be available
for apportionment to that State.”.

(h) ZERO TOLERANCE BLOOD ALCOHOL CONCENTRATION FOR
MINORS.—Section 161(a) of title 23, United States Code, is
amended-—

(1) by striking paragraph (1);

(2) by redesignating paragraph (2) as paragraph (1);

(3) in paragraph (1) (as so redesignated)—

(A) by striking the paragraph heading and inserting

“PRIOR TO FISCAL YEAR 2012”; and

(B) by inserting “through fiscal year 20117 after “each
fiscal year thereafter”; and

(4) by inserting after paragraph (1) (as so redesignated)
the following:

“(2) FISCAL YEAR 2012 AND THEREAFTER.—The Secretary
shall withhold an amount equal to 8 percent of the amount
required to be apportioned to any State under each of para-
graphs (1) and (2) of section 104(b) on October 1, 2011, and
on October 1 of each fiscal year thereafter, if the State does
not meet the requirement of paragraph (3) on that date.”.
(i) OPERATION OF MOTOR VEHICLES BY INTOXICATED PERSONS.—

Section 163(e) of title 23, United States Code, is amended by
striking paragraphs (1) and (2) and inserting the following:

“(1) FISCAL YEARS 2007 THROUGH 2011.—On October 1, 2006,
and October 1 of each fiscal year thereafter through fiscal
year 2011, if a State has not enacted or is not enforeing a
law described in subsection (a), the Secretary shall withhold
an amount equal to 8 percent of the amounts to be apportioned
to the State on that date under each of paragraphs (1), (3),
and (4) of section 104(b).

© “(2) FISCAL YEAR 2012 AND THEREAFTER.—On October 1,

2011, and October 1 of each fiscal year thereafter, if a State -

has not enacted or is not enforcing a law deseribed in subsection

(a), the Secretary shall withhold an amount equal to 6 percent

of the amounts to be apportioned to the State on that date

under each of paragraphs (1) and (2) of section 104(b).”.

(j) COMMERCIAL DRIVER’S LICENSE.—Section 81314 of title 49,
United States Code, is amended—

(1) by redesignating subsection (¢} as subsection (d); and -

(2) by inserting after subsection (b) the following:

“(c) PENALTIES IMPOSED IN FISCAL YEAR 2012 AND THERE-
" APTER.—Effective beginning on October 1, 2011—



126 STAT. 560 PUBLIC LAW 112-141—JULY 6, 2012

Deadline.

“(1) the penalty for the first instance of noncompliance
by a State under this section shall be not more than an amount
equal to 4 percent of funds required to be apportioned to the

- noncompliant State under paragraphs (1) and (2) of section
104(b) of title 23; and

“(2) the penalty for subsequent instances of noncompliance
shall be not more than an amount equal to 8 percent of funds
required to be apportioned to the noncompliant State under
paragraphs (1) and (2) of section 104(b) of title 23.”.

SEC. 1405. HIGHWAY WORKER SAFETY.

Not later.than 60 days after the date of enactment of this
Act, the Secretary shall modify section 630.1108(a) of title 23,
Code of Federal Regulations (as in effect on the date of enaciment
of this Act), to ensure that— ,

(1) at a minimum, positive protective measures are used
to separate workers on highway construction projects from
motorized traffic in all work zones conducted under traffic
in areas that offer workers no means of escape (such as tunnels
and bridges), unless an engineering study -determines other-
wise;

(2) temporary longitudinal traffic barriers are used to pro-
tect workers on highway construction projects in long-duration
stationary work zones when the project design speed is antici-
pated to be high and the nature of the work requires workers
to be within 1 lane-width from the edge of a live travel lane,
unless—

(A) an analysis by the project sponsor determines
otherwise; or

(B) the project is outside of an urbanized area and
the annual average daily traffic load of the applicable road
is less than 100 vehicles per hour; and

(3) when positive protective devices are necessary for high-
way construction projects, those devices are paid for on a unit-
pay basis, unless doing so would create a conflict with innova-
tive contracting approaches, such as design-build or some
performance-based contracts under which the contractor is paid
to assume a certain risk allocation and payment is generally
made on a lump-sum basis.

Subtitle E—Miscellaneous

SEC. 1501. REAL-TIME RIDESHARING.

Paragraph (3) of section 101(a) of title 23, United States Code
(as redesignated by section 1103(a)}2)), is amended by striking
“and designating existing facilities for use for preferential parking
for carpools” and inserting “designating existing facilities for use
for preferential parking for carpools, and real-time ridesharing
projects, such as projects where drivers, using an electronic transfer
of funds, recover costs directly associated with the trip provided
through the use of location technology to quantify those direct
costs, subject to the condition that the cost recovered does not
exceed the cost of the trip provided”.



